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Join the Iowa Nurses Association for the  
2025 Town Hall Series!
The Iowa Nurses Association (INA) invites 
you to participate in our 2025 Virtual Town 
Hall Series, an informal, open forum de-
signed to spark meaningful conversations 
about the future of nursing in Iowa. These 
complimentary events offer a unique op-
portunity for nurses across the state to 
share insights, voice concerns, and col-
laborate on innovative ideas to enhance 
nursing practice and healthcare in our 
communities.

Our goal is simple: to provide robust 
support to Iowa’s nurses while developing 
strategic goals and initiatives that align 
with INA’s mission and vision.

Why Attend?
•	 �Engage: Join a vibrant discussion with 

fellow nurses and share your experi-
ences.

•	 �Influence: Help shape initiatives that di-
rectly impact nursing in Iowa.

•	 �Learn: Discover how INA is actively 
working to support and advocate for 
nurses statewide.
These town halls are open to all Iowa 

nurses, regardless of INA membership 
status. If you’re not yet a member, this is a 
perfect opportunity to learn more about 
our work and see firsthand how INA is 
making a difference.

Your voice matters! Your participation 
will not only enrich our discussions but 
also help us craft actionable strategies to 
improve healthcare for both nurses and 
patients. We look forward to seeing you 
there, together, let’s build a stronger, more 
resilient nursing community in Iowa! n
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